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ABSTRACT 

The present study was carried out to investigate the differences in the levels of 

depression, anxiety and stress among junior and senior police officers of Khyber 

Pukhtoonkhwa province of Pakistan. The inquiry included 315 police officers from 

different districts of the understudied province.  Depression Anxiety and Stress Scale 

(Lovibond & Lovibond, 1995) was administered. It was hypothesized that junior 

police officers would project higher levels of depression, anxiety and stress as 

compared to senior police officers. The results supported the hypothesis on highly 

significant differences and were consistent with the earlier studies of similar nature. 
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INTRODUCTION 

Depression, anxiety and stress are the most commonly diagnosed illnesses in Psychology 

(Brown, Chorpita, Korotitsch & Barlow, 1997; Davies, Norman, Cortese & Malla, 1995; 

Farmer, 1998; Ollendick & Yule, 1990). Several studies have associated these syndromes to 

numerous negative outcomes in the workplace, such as decreased performance and 

satisfaction (Cavanaugh, Boswell, Roehling & Boudreau, 2000; Greenberg, 1999; Poole, 

1993; Seaward, 1999). The outcomes of depression, anxiety and stress are also associated 

with negative outcomes in other aspects of life, including general satisfaction (Kessler et al., 

1994; Youngren & Lewinsohn, 1980), quality of life (Norvell, Hills & Murrin, 1993), and 
social interactions (Alden & Phillips, 1990; Davies et al., 1995). Traditionally, it was 

believed that stress, anxiety and depression were separate constructs with varying etiologies 
and symptoms; however, the high co-morbidity rates, especially between anxiety and 

depression, have gained interest and attention throughout the field (Lovibond & Lovibond, 
1995; Stavrakaki &Vargo, 1986; Dobson, 1985; Feldman, 1993).  

Police work is generally regarded as a highly stressful occupation (Violante, 1983). Policing 

is considered as the most psychologically dangerous profession worldwide (Axel & Valle, 

1979).  Police officers perform jobs that are recognized as suffering from high levels of stress 

by performing tasks that are both physically and emotionally demanding (Kopel & Friedman, 

1999; Schwartz & Schwartz, 1981; Stotland, 1991). Stress in police officers and other law 
enforcement personnel is an inspiring area for the researchers. Studies have linked various 

stressors of police work to psychological distress, depression, anxiety, alcoholism, burnout, 
cardiac disorders and suicide; as well as family and marital problems (Biggam, Power, & 

MacDonald, 1997; Kop, Euwema, & Schaufeli, 1999; Loo, 1999; Territo & Vetter, 1981; 
Violanti, 1992). Evidence also suggests that police officers are at increased risk for suicide 

(Violanti, 2004; Violanti, Castellano, O’Rourke, & Paton, 2006; Kposowa, 1999; 
Charbonneau, 2000; Darensburg et al., 2006; Hartwig and Violanti, 1999).  

The current study was aimed to investigate the levels of depression, anxiety and stress among 

police officers on the basis of their official ranks.  It was hypothesized that junior police 
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officers will have higher levels of depression, anxiety and stress as compared with senior 

police officers. 

METHOD 

Participants 

The research participants were 315 randomly selected police officers who further included 

officers with low official ranks i.e. constables (n=165) and officers with high official ranks 

i.e. sub-inspectors and above (n=150). The participants belonged to districts of Peshawar, 
Abbottabad and Mardan of Khyber Pukhtoonkhwa province of Pakistan.  

Instrument 

Depression, Anxiety and Stress Scale (Lovibond & Lovibond, 1995) 

The Depression, Anxiety and Stress Scale (DASS) comprises of 42 items. It is a self-report 

inventory that deals with three different but relevant factors i.e. depression, anxiety, and 

stress. Each of the three DASS scales contains 14 items, divided into subscales of 2-5 items 

with similar content. Reliability of the three scales is considered appropriate and test-retest 

reliability is similarly considered adequate with .71 for depression, .79 for anxiety and .81 for 

stress (Brown et al., 1997).  

Procedure 

After acquiring a written permission from the Inspector General of the Frontier Police Force, 

the participants of the research were individually approached by the researcher in three 
districts of the province i.e. Peshawar, Abbottabad and Mardan. The officers in-charge of 

different police stations facilitated the research procedure. The participants were informed 
about the purpose of the study and their consent to participate was obtained.The participants 

responded to the instrument in individual settings and the issues of confidentiality and 
secrecy were also made clear to them. Demographic information was collected after 

establishing a satisfactory level of rapport with them. This information did not include their 

identities. The instructions which were already mentioned in the instrument were also made 

clear to them. The researcher was available for the respondent in case the respondent needed 

help in translating / understanding difficult words. The subjects and the facilitators were 

acknowledged for their cooperation. The scores obtained were analyzed using the Statistical 

Package for Social Sciences (SPSS).  

RESULTS 

In order to see the difference in the scores of the police officers for Depression as an effect of 

their official ranks (Low and High ranks), the scores of the two groups were compared as 
under: 

Table 1. Means, standard deviations and t-value of the Depression scores of the Police Officers 

with Low and High Official Ranks on Depression, Anxiety & Stress Scale 

Group n M SD t-value 

Low Ranks 165 25.47 4.82 
11.59 

High Ranks 150 18.18 6.30 

df= 313; p<.001 

The above table shows highly significant difference between the Police Officers with Low 

and High Official Ranks on Depression, Anxiety & Stress Scale by Depression Scores  (t= 
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11.59, p<.001). The figures show that Police Officers with Low Official Ranks have more 

depression (M=25.47, SD=4.82) as compared to Police Officers with High Official Ranks 

(M=18.18, SD=6.30). 

In order to see the difference in the scores of the police officers for Anxiety as an effect of 

their official ranks (Low and High ranks), the scores of the two groups were compared as 

under: 

Table 2. Means, standard deviations and t-value of the Anxiety scores of the Police Officers with 

Low and High Official Ranks on Depression, Anxiety & Stress Scale 

Group n M SD t-value 

Low Ranks 165 26.10 4.93 

9.46 

High Ranks 150 20.28 5.97 

df= 313; p<.001 

The above table shows highly significant difference between the Police Officers with Low 

and High Official Ranks on Depression, Anxiety & Stress Scale by Anxiety Scores  (t= 9.46, 

p<.001). The figures show that Police Officers with Low Official Ranks have more anxiety 

(M=26.10, SD=4.93) as compared to Police Officers with High Official Ranks (M=20.28, 

SD=5.97).  

In order to see the difference in the scores of the police officers for Stress as an effect of their 

official ranks (Low and High ranks), the scores of the two groups were compared as under: 

Table 3. Means, standard deviations and t-value of the Stress scores of the Police Officers with 

Low and High Official Ranks on Depression, Anxiety & Stress Scale 

Group n M SD t-value 

Low Ranks 165 25.72 5.29 

7.91 

High Ranks 150 20.64 6.11 

df= 313; p<.001 

The above table shows highly significant difference between the Police Officers with Low 

and High Official Ranks on Depression, Anxiety & Stress Scale by Stress Scores  (t= 7.91, 

p<.001). The figures show that Police Officers with Low Official Ranks have more stress 

(M=25.72, SD=5.29) as compared to Police Officers with High Official Ranks (M=20.64, 

SD=6.11).  

DISCUSSION 

The results of the current study reveal that the junior police officers reflected higher levels of 

depression, anxiety and stress as compared to senior police officers. The officers 

understudied were having easily observable psychological distress due to severe workload 

and departmental difficulties. This workload is usually considered socially and financially 

unrewarding by the police and reduces the levels of job satisfaction among them. Insufficient 

remuneration and disrespect from the society were the two major stressors which were found 

while conducting additional interviews with officers of different ranks.  

The previous studied conducted in this regard also reveal that Depression, anxiety and stress 
are significant outputs in stressful working settings (Bennett, Williams, Page, Hood & 
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Woollard, 2004; Caplan, 1994). Researches specifically focusing on the ranks of police 

officers in relation to depression, anxiety and/or stress are also found in alliance with the 

findings of the current study. Bartol (1982) studied 102 police officers in Vermont and 

reported that low level officers had more psychological problems as compared to high level 

officers.  Other researchers (Brown & Campbell, 1990; Gejdenson & Adlam, 1985) reveal 

that non-managerial and younger police officers experience a greater frequency of serious 

operational tasks than other police, whereas managers, middle managers and investigators 
experienced more job pressure. These differences are most likely a result of rank and the 

main task. 

REFERENCES 

[1] Alden, L., & Phillips, N. (1990). An interpersonal analysis of social anxiety and 
depression. Cognitive Therapy and Research, 14(5), 499-513. 

[2] Axel, B. M., & Valle, J. (1979). South Florida’s approach to police stress management. 

Police Stress, 1, 13-14. 

[3] Bartol, C. R. (1982). Psychological characteristics of small-town police officers. 

Journal of Police Science and Administration, 10(1), 58-63. 

[4] Bennett, P., Williams, Y., Page, N., Hood, K., Woollard, M. (2004). Levels of mental 
Health Problems among UK emergency ambulance workers. Emerging Medicine 

Journal, 21, 235–236. 

[5] Biggam, F. H., Power, K. G., & MacDonald, R. R., (1997). Coping with the 

occupational stressors of police work: A study of Scottish officers. Stress Medicine, 13, 

109–115. 

[6] Brown, J. M., & Campbell, E.A. (1990). Sources of occupational stress in the police. 
Work Stress, 4, 305–318. 

[7] Brown, T., Chorpita, B., Korotitsch, W., & Barlow, D. (1997). Psychometric properties 

of the Depression Anxiety Stress Scales (DASS) in clinical samples. Behavior 

Research and Therapy, 35, 79-89. 

[8] Caplan, R. P. (1994). Stress, anxiety, and depression in hospital consultants, general 

practitioners, and senior health service managers. British Medical Journal, 309, 1261–

63. 

[9] Cavanaugh, M., Boswell, W., Roehling, M., & Boudreau, J. (2000). An empirical 
examination of self-reported work stress among U.S. managers. Journal of Applied 

Psychology, 85(1), 65-74. 

[10] Charbonneau, F. (2000). Suicide among the police in Quebec. Population, 55, 367–

378. 

[11] Darensburg, T., Andrew, M. E., Hartley, T., Burchfeil, C. M., Fekedulegn, D., & 

Violanti, J. M. (2006). Gender and ages differences in posttraumatic stress disorder and 

depression among Buffalo police officers. Traumatology, 12, 200–228. 

[12] Davies, F., Norman, R., Cortese, L., & Malla, A. (1995). The relationship between 
types of anxiety and depression. The Journal of Nervous and Mental Disease, 183, 31-

35. 

[13] Dobson, K. (1985). The relationship between anxiety and depression. Clinical 

Psychology Review, 5, 307-324. 



Academic Research International   Vol. 5(3)  May  2014    

____________________________________________________________________ ____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________    

    
Copyright © 2014 SAVAP International                                                                            ISSN: 2223-9944,  eISSN: 2223-9553 

www.savap.org.pk                                                    243                                www.journals.savap.org.pk 

[14] Farmer, R. (1998). Depressive symptoms as a function of trait anxiety and impulsivity. 

Journal of Clinical Psychology, 54, 129-135. 

[15] Feldman, L. (1993). Distinguishing depression and anxiety in self-report: Evidence 
fromconfirmatory factor analysis on nonclinical and clinical samples. Journal of 

Consulting and Clinical Psychology, 61(4), 631-638. 

[16] Greenberg, J. (1999).  Comprehensive stress management. Dubuque, IA: WCB 

McGraw-Hill. 

[17] Gudjonsson, G. H., Adlam, K. R. (1985). Occupational stressors among British police. 

Police Journal, 58, 73–80. 

[18] Hartwig, D., & Violanti, J. M. (1999). Suicide of police officials in Northern-

Westfalen: An evaluation of 58 suicides between 1992–1998. Archiv Fur 

Kriminologue, 5(6), 129–142. 

[19] Kessler, R. C., McGonagle, K. A., Zhao, S., Nelson, C. B., Hughes, M., Eshleman, S., 

Wittchen, H. U., & Kendler, K. S. (1994). Lifetime and 12-month prevalence of DSM-

III-R psychiatric disorders in the United States: Results from the National Comorbidity 

Study. Archives of General Psychiatry, 51(1), 8–19. 

[20] Kop, N., Euwema, M., & Schaufeli, W. (1999). Burnout, job stress and violent 

behaviour among Dutch police officers. Work Stress, 13, 326-340. 

[21] Kopel, H., & Friedman, M. (1999). Effects of Exposure to Violence in South African 
Police. In J. Violanti., & D. Paton (Eds.) Police Trauma: Psychological Aftermath of 

Civilian Combat. Springfield, IL: Charles C. Thomas. 

[22] Kposowa, J. (1999). Suicide mortality in the United States: Differentials by industrial 

and occupational groups. American Journal of Industrial Medicine, 36, 645–652. 

[23] Loo, R., (1999). Police suicide: The ultimate stress reaction. In J. M. Violanti & D. 

Paton (Eds.), Police trauma: Psychological aftermath of civilian combat (pp. 241–254). 

Springfield, IL: Charles C. Thomas. 

[24] Lovibond, P. (1998). Long-term stability of depression, anxiety and stress syndromes. 
Journal of Abnormal Psychology, 107, 520–526.  

[25] Lovibond, P. F., & Lovibond, S. H. (1995).  The structure of negative emotional states: 

Comparison of the Depression Anxiety Stress Scales (DASS) with the Beck Depression 

and Anxiety Inventories. Behavior Research and Therapy, 33, 335-343. 

[26] Lovibond, S., & Lovibond, P. (1995). Manual for the Depression Anxiety Stress Scales 

(2
nd 

Edition). Sydney: Psychology Foundation. 

[27] Norvell, N., Hills, H., & Murrin, M. (1993). Understanding stress in female and male 

law enforcement officers. Psychology of Women Quarterly, 17, 289-301. 

[28] Ollendick, T., & Yule, W. (1990). Depression in British and American children and its 

relation to anxiety and fear. Journal of Consulting and Clinical Psychology, 58(1), 126-

129. 

[29] Poole, W. (1993). The art of healing. Atlanta, GA: Turner. 

[30] Schwartz, J., & C. Schwartz. (1981). The Personal Problems for the Police Officer: A 

Plea for Action. In L. Territo& H. Vetter (Eds.) Stress and Police Personnel. Boston: 

Allyn and Bacon. 



Academic Research International   Vol. 5(3)  May  2014    

____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ ____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________    

    
Copyright © 2014 SAVAP International                                                                            ISSN: 2223-9944,  eISSN: 2223-9553 

www.savap.org.pk                                             244                                       www.journals.savap.org.pk 

[31] Seaward, B. (1999). Managing Stress: Principles and strategies for health and well-

being. Sudbury, MA: Jones and Bartlett.  

[32] Stavrakaki, C., & Vargo, B. (1986). The relationship of anxiety and depression: A 
review of the literature. British Journal of Psychiatry, 149, 7–16. 

[33] Stotland, E. (1991). The Effects of Police Work and Professional Relationships on 

Health. Journal of Criminal Justice, 19, 371-379. 

[34] Territo, L., & Vetter, H. J. (1981). Stress and police personnel. Journal of Police 

Science and Administration, 9, 195–208. 

[35] Violante, J. M. (1983). Stress patterns in police work, A longitudinal study. Journal of 

Police Science and Administration, 11, 211-216 

[36] Violanti, J. M. (1992). Coping strategies among police recruits in a high-stress training 

environment. Journal of Social Psychology, 132, 717–729. 

[37] Violanti, J. M. (2004). Predictors of police suicide ideation. Suicide and Life 

Threatening Behavior, 4, 277–283. 

[38] Violanti, J. M., Castellano, C., O’Rourke, J., & Paton, D. (2006). Proximity to the 9/11 

terrorist attack and suicide ideation in police officers. Traumatology, 12, 248–254. 

[39] Youngren, M., & Lewinsohn, P. (1980). The functional relationship between 

depression and problematic interpersonal behavior. Journal of Abnormal Psychology, 

89(3), 333-341. 

 

 

 

 

 

 


